BID TABULATION—July 8, 2022
2022-Y HOUSING — E. COOPER

BIDDER BIDDER

LEWIS BROS INC DSW HOMES
1. Operation

$1,000.00 $1,000.00
1a. Manuals SN/A SN/A
1c. Plumbing
$950.00 $500.00
2. Sloped
Roofing $36,148.00 $17,650.00
TOTAL
$ 38,098.00 $19,150.00

Witnessed by: LaShanda Taylor and Mike Null




BID TABULATION—July 8, 2022
2022-Y HOUSING — F. HARRIS-ROBINSON

BIDDER BIDDER
LEWIS BROS INC DSW HOMES
1. Operation
$1,500.00 $1,000.00
1a. Manuals
SN/A S N/A
2. Fascia/
Soffit $ 14,000.00 $ 6,875.00
2a. Sloped
Roofing $ 18,700.00 $ 7,500.00
2b. Low Sloped
Roofing $ 14,500.00 $4,500.00
3. Entry/Exit
Door $1,500.00 $450.00
TOTAL
$ 50,200.00 $ 20,325.00

Witnessed by: LaShanda Taylor and Mike Null




BID TABULATION—July 8, 2022
2022-Y HOUSING — H. WILLIAMS

BIDDER BIDDER
LEWIS BROS INC DSW HOMES
1. Operation
No Bid $1,000.00
1a. Manuals
No Bid S N/A
2. Fascia/
Soffit No Bid $ 8,000.00
3. Ext. Wall
Siding No Bid $52,500.00
4. Sloped
Roofing No Bid $10,500.00
TOTAL
No Bid $ 72,000.00

Witnessed by: LaShanda Taylor and Mike Null




BID TABULATION—IJuly 8, 2022
2022-Y HOUSING - V. WARD

BIDDER BIDDER
LEWIS BROS INC DSW HOMES
1. Operations $ 2,000.00 $1,000.00
1a. Manuals SN/A S N/A
2. HVAC $ 3,500.00 $ 500.00
3. Plumbing $1,500.00 $1,000.00
4. Sloped $ 15,650.00 $ 8,000.00
Roofing
5. Front Ramp $ 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00
5a. Rear Ramp $ 7,500.00 $ 6,500.00
6. Windows $ 500.00 $ 300.00
TOTAL $ 38,150.00 $ 24,800.00

Witnessed by: LaShanda Taylor and Mike Null




BID TABULATION—July 8, 2022
2022-Y HOUSING - E. HOGG

BIDDER BIDDER
LEWIS BROS INC DSW HOMES
1a. Operations NO BID $ 1,000.00
1b. Manuals NO BID SN/A
2a. HVAC NO BID $10,500.00
3a. Roof NO BID $9,000.00
4a. Bathroom NO BID $2,600.00
Shower
4b. Toilet NO BID NIC
5a. Water NO BID $1,150.00
Heater
TOTAL NO BID S 24,450.00

Witnessed by:

LaShanda Taylor and Mike Null




BID TABULATION—July 8, 2022
2022-Y HOUSING -D. GADDIS

BIDDER BIDDER
LEWIS BROS INC DSW HOMES
1. Operations NO BID $ 1,000.00
1a. Manuals NO BID SN/A
2. HVAC NO BID $ 500.00
3. Door Lock NO BID $100.00
3a. Storm NO BID $ 365.00
Door
4. Flooring NO BID $19,750.00
5. Shower NO BID $1,050.00
Enclosure
5a. Vanity NO BID $ 800.00
TOTAL NO BID $ 23,565.00

Witnessed by: LaShanda Taylor and Mike Null




